
© 2025 HUSCH BLACKWELL LLP. ALL RIGHTS RESERVED HUSCHBLACKWELL.COM

Tyler J. Lindberg
ATTORNEY

THE LINK VIRTUAL OFFICE

PHONE: 312.526.1514

CHICAGO, IL*

PHONE: 312.655.1500

EMAIL: TYLER.LINDBERG@HUSCHBLACKWELL.COM

OVERVIEW

Tyler defends clients in asbestos and other 
toxic tort litigation.
Although Tyler came to his legal career knowing he aimed to work 
in personal injury litigation, he originally planned to represent 
plaintiffs. However, after he accepted his first role in a defense 
firm, he realized how much he enjoyed partnering with 
sophisticated clients and large corporations. Serving as a legal team 
leader for multinational, household-name brands confirmed his 
interest, and Tyler went on to represent a variety of manufacturers, 
contractors, suppliers, premises owners, and insurers in mass tort 
cases. While he has experience with traditional product liability 
work, his primary focus has always been toxic tort, particularly 
asbestos.

Hoping to grow his career at a firm that was a major player in the 
asbestos space, Tyler joined Husch Blackwell in 2024. He focuses 
almost exclusively on asbestos matters for major corporations and 
conglomerates, handling litigation in some of Illinois’s most 
difficult jurisdictions for defendants, including St. Clair County, 
Madison County, and Cook County, as well as Indiana’s Marion 
County. After nearly a decade in asbestos, Tyler knows most of the 
plaintiff firms in the area and understands the nuances of working 
with each of them.

In addition to his ability to collaborate with opposing counsel and 
negotiate a favorable settlement, Tyler is also known for his 
confidence as a speaker and in depositions, helping him secure 
exactly the information a case needs. Clients also appreciate his 
extensive experience with trial preparation: with cases that often 
settle on the eve of trial, Tyler is always ready to try a case when 
necessary.
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Experience

• Represented clients in all aspects of toxic tort litigation including management of several 

hundred case files from inception to resolution.

• Defended premises owners, insulation contractors, and manufacturers of boilers, pumps, 

electrical equipment, automotive friction products, cosmetic talc products, and more.

• Served as team leader on multiple client accounts including a boiler manufacturer, insulation 

contractors, first time defendants, and major multinational corporations in St. Clair, Madison, 

and Cook County in Illinois, Marion County, Indiana, and Polk County, Iowa.

• Analyzed testimony, discovery, medical records, and client-specific information to assess 

liability to effectuate bulk settlements and dismissals across Illinois.

Education

• J.D., University of Illinois Chicago School of Law

○ Dean Fred F. Herzog Moot Court Competition, First Place Winner out of 116 

participants

• B.A., DePaul University

Admissions

• Illinois

*Contact Tyler to set up an in-person consultation by appointment in the Chicago office.
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